

Kilkenny Greyhound Stadium SALES SATURDAY 12th July 2014

Trial 1 Result: 5 1 3 Time: 29-70 Distances: SHD 18

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
1	1	DROOPYS GRACE	4.65	EVAW FINWLL		1900	Y
2	3	SLANEYSIDE SHANE	4.59	SLAW NVSH		100	Y
3	5	GENEVA DANNY	4.43	FAW ALD		1650	Y

Trial 2 Result: 2 6 4 Time: 29.77 Distances: 1 10.5

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
4	2	MONROE BORO	4.66	SLAW CK3	4,000	2,000	N
5	4	TRAPPER MICKEY	4.60	SLAW NVSH		200	Y
6	6	DROOPYS DASH	4.50	FAW EVCH	0	1500	Y

Trial 3 Result: 1 5 3 Time: 30.06 Distances: 4 16

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
7	1	GENEVA OSCAR	4.63	SLAW FINWL		1400	Y
8	3	SLANEYSIDE SMASH	4.68	SLAW NVSH		150	Y
10	5	MILLTOWN LADY	4.53	LD EVCH		150	Y

Trial 4 Result: 2 6 4 Time: 29.77 Distances: 4 4

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
11	2	TRAPPER RICKY	4.43	FAW FINWL		3100	Y
12	4	BLACK ARROW	4.53	EVAW RNON		700	Y
13	6	DROOPYS IPOD	4.56	EVAW FINWL		1500	Y

Trial 5 Result: 5 3 1 Time: 29.85 Distances: 7.5 4

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
14	1	DOOLEYS DANCE	4.58	EVAW RNON		350	Y
15	3	TRAPPER JACK	4.54	EVAW RNON		400	Y
16	5	DANCE CARLA	4.48	FAW ALD		1400	Y

Trial 6 Result: 4 6 2 Time: 29.80 Distances: 7 5

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
17	2	GOOD FIFI	4.57	EVAW CK 3		150	Y
18	4	SLANEYSIDE SASHA	4.44	FAW ALD		1100	Y
20	6	PLEASANT REPORT	4.55	EVAW BMP 1		950	Y

Trial 7 Result: 1 3 5 Time: 29.40 Distances: 10 9

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
21	1	DROOPYS EMOJI	4.56	EVAW FINWL		4600	Y
22	3	TRIANGLE KYLIE	4.49	EVAW RNON		250	Y
23	5	POOKIES TIMMY	4.35	QAW FD		400	Y

Kilkenny Greyhound Stadium SALES SATURDAY 12th July 2014

Trial 8

Result: 4 2 6

Time: 29.96

Distances: 8 .5

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
24	2	OUTLIER NELSON	4.55	EVAW CK 1		400	Y
25	4	AMIDUS CITY	4.47	FAW ALD		600	Y
26	6	TRIANGLE HEATHER	4.52	CRD 1 RNON		300	Y

Trial 9

Result: 5 3 1

Time: 30.05

Distances: 4 0.5

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
27	1	CHEEKY AMBITION	4.55	EVAW CK 4		500	Y
28	3	RATHBEG HERO	4.47	FAW CK 4		400	Y
29	5	AMIDUS HERE	4.45	FAW FINWL	2000	800	N

Trial 10

Result: 2 4 6

Time: 29.92

Distances: SHD 16

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
30	2	TRIANGLE TILLY	4.48	EVAW FINWL		350	Y
32	4	WASH THE HAND	4.40	FAW HDNRL		1750	Y
34	6	TEMERITY	4.55	EVAW NVSH		150	Y

Trial 11

Result: 3 1 5

Time: 30.22

Distances: 1 6

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
35	1	PINNACLE NINJA	4.52	EVAW CK 1		250	Y
36	3	SPIKES HOPE	4.40	FAW ALD		900	Y
37	5	MONALEE JUDY	4.52	EVAW BLK 1		200	Y

Trial 12

Result: 4 6 2

Time: 30.26

Distances: 1.5 SHD

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
38	2	SAN MIGUEL	4.49	FAW HDNRL		0	N
39	4	KILGRANEY APRIL	4.63	SLAW FINWLL	1000	500	N
40	6	WHAT A JOY	4.69	SLAW FINWL		200	Y

Trial 13

Result: 5 3 1

Time: 29.94

Distances: 4.5 3.5

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
41	1	TYLERS MASTER	4.57	EVAW RNON		400	Y
44	3	LOCNAMON SARAH	4.53	CK 1 IMP 2			N
46	5	LIVE IMPACT	4.49	BMPRU FINWL	1500	1000	N

Trial 14

Result: 6 2 4

Time: 30.15

Distances: 2.5 3.5

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
47	2	KILARA KING	4.57	CK 1 CK 3	1000	500	N
52	4	WINDGAP FALCON	4.68	SLAW RNON		NO	N
54	6	THAT'S THE SHOT	4.42	FAW ALD		500	Y

Kilkenny Greyhound Stadium SALES SATURDAY 12th July 2014

Trial 15 Result: 1 5 3 Time: 30.26 Distances: 2 NK

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
55	1	TOWN RUMBLE	4.55	BLK 1 FINWL	800	300	N
57	3	WINDGAP MOVER	4.55	SLAW BLKD1		350	Y
58	5	FUTURE VENTURE	4.43	BLK 1 RNON		200	Y

Trial 16 Results: 6 4 2 Time: 29.57 Distances: 2 DIST

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
60	2	MILFORD SHEILA	4.54	CK 1 NVSH		NO BID	N
61	4	CHUMS FIVER	4.45	FAW RNON	1500	1100	N
63	6	ASCOT WOODIE	4.41	FAW ALD	1200	2500	N

Trial 17 Results: 1 5 3 Time: 29.98 Distances: 2 4.5

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
64	1	FLOMUR LIBERTY	4.42	FAW FINWL	1000	350	N
65	3	HIGH ST BLAKE	4.64	SLAW RNON		150	Y
67	5	BLACKSTONE HUGH	4.36	FAW EVCH		350	Y

Trial 18 Result: 4 2 6 Time: 29.77 Distances: 1 1

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
68	2	ASCOT DYNAMO	4.34	QAW EVCH	2000	950	N
69	4	BALLYBOUGH OZ	4.39	FAW FINWL	1500	1200	N
70	6	THATSTHEWAYMIKE	4.46	EVAW FINWL		500	Y

Trial 19 Result: 3 5 1 Time: 29.85 Distances: 3 7.5

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
73	1	KILBRIENS BULLET	4.58	EVAW RNON		NO BID	N
74	3	AMAZING FELLA	4.57	EVAW FINWL	800	550	N
75	5	THAT'S HIM NOW	4.48	FAW RNON		400	Y

Trial 20 Result: 4 6 2 Time: 29.75 Distances: 10.5 3

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
78	2	BAILEPHOIL LASS	4.49	EVAW EVCH		100	Y
79	4	TRI BOROUGH	4.40	FAW ALD	0	1100	Y
80	6	KILFANE KING	4.56	EVAW CK 3		600	Y

Trial 21 Results: 1 3 5 Time: 30.09 Distances: 4.5 4

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
81	1	RANDOM MEAVE	4.46	FAW ALD		300	Y
82	3	MAS HOSTAGE	4.56	BMPRU RNON		NO BID	N
84	5	NORESIDE LIVE	4.60	SLAW RNON		NO BID	N

Kilkenny Greyhound Stadium SALES SATURDAY 12th July 2014

Trial 22 Result: 4 6 2 Time: 29.65 Distances: 11.5 2

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
85	2	RANDOM NOTION	4.60	BMP1 BMP 3	500	150	N
87	4	CROSSLEIGH THYME	4.54	EVAW FINWL		700	Y
88	6	ASCOT RORY	4.46	BMP 1 CK 3		NO BID	N

Trial 23 Results: 3 5 1 Time: 29.45 Distances: 13 8.5

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
89	1	GATILLOS SOPHIE	4.64			NO BID	N
92	3	BLACKSTONE CHIEF	4.59	EVAW FINWL		700	Y
93	5	OUTLIER STUDENT	4.69	CK 2		NO BID	N

Trial 24 Result: 4 6 2 Time: 29.61 Distances: 2 5.5

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
94	6	WOODSGIFT DIVA	4.49	FAW STYON		900	Y
96	2	BLACKSTONE MAXX	4.57	EVAW RNON		NO BID	N
97	4	SHAWS BLAZE	4.44	FAW ALD		NO BID	N

Trial 25 Results: 5 1 3 Time: 29.89 Distances: 8 14

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
50	1	CUSHIE FREO	4.62	SLAW RNON		150	Y
77	3	BROOKLEY BLUE	4.73	SLAW NVSH		NO BID	N
71	5	JUMBO STEPS	4.52	ALD CLR		1000	Y

Trial 26 Results: 4 2 Time: 29.61 Distances: 11

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
91	2	KISHLAWN WARRIOR	4.56			NO BID	N
98	4	PURE PALOMAR	4.43	FAW ALD		NO BID	N

SPRINTS

Trial 27 Results: 3 1 5 Time: 16.90 Distances: 5 2

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
42	1	BRANDIE LOVE		SLAW RNON		200	Y
43	3	BUSH HILL ALEX		FAW ALD	400	300	N
51	5	MICK CASTLE		EVAW CK 1		NO BID	N

